

Client:	Village of Northfield	Fee:	\$20.00
Project:	2017 Utility Improvements	Payable To:	Gewalt Hamilton Associates
GHA Project No:	3509.033	Bid Opening:	2/9/17 - 10:00 A.M.
Project Manager:	Pat Glenn/Lucas Deferville	Bid Opening Location:	Northfield Public Works

BID RESULTS

Contractor	Bid (As-Read)
A Lamp	\$616,995.50
Berger Excavating	NO BID
Bolder	\$570,625.00
Campanella & Sons	\$738,266.73
DiMeo Brothers	NO BID
Elanar	\$574,778.00
Gerardi Sewer & Water	NO BID
H. Linden & Son Sewer/Water	NO BID
J Congdon Sewer Svc., Inc.	\$677,777.00
John Neri Construction	\$571,252.00
Lenny Hoffman	\$589,981.00
Maneval Construction	\$619,223.99
Martam	\$646,650.90
Mauro Sewer	\$529,797.00
RA Mancini	\$575,324.25
Vian Construction	\$653,776.41
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE	\$639,882.00